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Species include Western Kob, Western Hartebeest, 
Harnessed Bushbuck, Sing Sing Waterbuck, Nagor 
Reedbuck, Oribi and Bush Duiker.

Trophy fees are quoted in Euros and are subject 
to fluctuation.  They are, however, very attractive 
when compared to other countries for the same or 
similar species.

Please see the insert in this brochure for a 
complete list of trophy fees and other government 
license and concession fees.

If an early in the year safari is what you seek, or 
one of the best values in the hunting world that 
provides excellent trophy quality is your dream, 
then Benin deserves your serious consideration. 

18



Breaking Records... it’s what we do!

If Western Roan or Western Buffalo are on your list 
of desired trophies then Benin deserves serious 
consideration.  This largely unpublicized country 
in western Africa has an enviable record for quality 
trophies.  The outfitter has years of experience in 
organizing safaris in the Porga Zone on the edge of 
Pendjari National Park and consistently produces 
quality trophies.

While the Western Buffalo may be smaller in both 
body size and horn configuration than his southern 
cousin, he is every bit as challenging to hunt.  
Large bulls can approach 900 pounds and their 
temperament will never win a congeniality contest.  
They remain one of the most underrated trophies 
on the continent.

Hunting is conducted early in the year with the 
season beginning in January and continuing 
through April.  Northern hemisphere clients think 
“winter” but in this near equatorial hunting area 
temperatures can reach well above 100 degrees 
during mid-day so a comfortable cool camp is a 
welcome sight at the end of a long session “on the 
track.”  To assure comfort, the outfitter provides 
generator powered air conditioning in the camps.  
Accommodations are bungalows with in-suite 
shower and toilet facilities and all the other 
amenities you have come to expect on an African 
Safari.  Transportation to and from the hunting area 
is provided by hunting car so costly air charters 
are not needed but can be arranged at the client’s 
request.  For the hunter venturing to Africa for the 
first safari, the price includes the loan of a scope 
sighted .375 H&H if desired. Safaris are offered for both 13-days and 20-days 

and on the longer safari it is possible to hunt 2x1.  
In addition to roan and buffalo, Benin also offers 
the opportunity to hunt lions.  They are hunted in 
the traditional method of tracking, since baiting is 
not allowed.  The hunter interested in lion should 
book for 13 days and concentrate on lion until 
successful, and then he can turn his attention 
to other trophies.  Typically, lions in the north 
don’t carry the thick manes found in eastern and 
southern countries but that does not diminish the 
challenge of the hunt and good lions are taken 
every year.

Besides roan, buffalo and lion, several species of 
antelope may be hunted. 




